City of Willoughby Hills Interoffice Memo

Date: Friday, February 16, 2018

To: Council President Fellows, Council Members and Council Clerk

From: Robert M. Weger, Mayor/Safety Director

Subject: Ordinance to Accept Limestone and Asphalt Bids

A bid opening was held on Friday, February 8, 2018, in response to our ad for our 2018 Asphalt and Limestone Program. A summary of all of the bids that were submitted is attached. Road Superintendent Mark Grubiss has requested that we accept the following as the lowest and best bid and I respectfully request that Council prepare an ordinance to allow me to accept the following bids:

Asphalt Bid: Presented by Grand River Asphalt Co., 6 US Coast Guard Road, Painesville, OH 44077

Limestone Bid: Presented by SOS Trucking Co., Inc., 6509 Brecksville Road, #31601, Cleveland, OH 44131

I would appreciate your consideration in passing this ordinance with an Emergency Clause which would eliminate thirty days from signing and allow us to begin road repair that much sooner. In addition, you may consider waiving the three-reading rule to once again allow for the paving to begin sooner.

cc: Mark Grubiss, Road Superintendent

Delivered as directed

City of Willoughby Hills Bidding Document

ASPHALT Requirements for 1 (one) year: 2018

	Picked UP	to	locations	within ity limits
2,000 tons ODOT 448 Type 1 Asphalt Concrete* (Surface Course)	\$ 59.00 per ton	\$	N/A	per ton
1,000 tons ODOT 448 Type 2 Asphalt Concrete* (Intermediate Course)	\$ 50.00 per ton	\$	N/A	per ton
500 tons ODOT 301 Asphalt Concrete Base *	\$_49.00 per ton	\$	N/A	per ton

(Tonnage of material is approximate usage - may purchase more or less)

*All asphalt cements shall meet AASHTO Provisional Standard MPI or any superseding AASHTO specification for performance graded asphalt cement binder Pg. 64-22. The bituminous mixes shall meet O.D.O.T. Specifications (2008 Edition)

The supplier shall provide documentation and certification to verify the above. The supplier shall also submit with the bid a proposed JMF for each mix.

ODOT 401.20 - "Asphalt Binder Price Adjustment" shall apply to this contract.

Plant Location(s): Provide on separate sheet if needed.

Location of Plant Nearest to Willoughby Hills: 6 US Coast Guard Rd. Painesville, OH 44077

Alternate Plant Locations:

Note: The above items may be bid in total or in part.

On items not bid, please enter " \$ No Bid per ton"

5% bid bond or certified check required.

Grand River Asphalt Co.

Company Name

6 US Coast Guard Rd. Painesville, OH 44077 Company Address, City, State & Zip

(440) 357-5562 Company Rhole Mather

Authorized Signatur

DATRNY Printed Name &

Bid Opening: Friday, February 9, 2018 at noon in Willoughby Hills Council Chambers, 35405 Chardon Road, Willoughby Hills, OH 44094

ŀ		0	L	G	ш	ų.	9	H	1	-	2
+	A	n							LIMESTONE (\$\$\$)	VE (\$\$\$) 3N	
-			HCH		Job Com.	301 20	301 del	304	411	57	1'S &2'S
2 0	Company Name	Type 1	I del.	1 ype z 11	Iype z uel.	100 100		(200 tons)	(600 tons)	(800 tons)	(200 tons)
m		2000	2000 tons	DI	1000 tons	** ******	*****	\$18 50	\$18.75		\$23.50
4	Ontario Stone Corp. *	******* NO BID	NO BID	* *****				dalivered	delivered	del	delivered
5 1	1246 River Road										
9	Cleveland, OH 44113								A A A A A A A A A A A A A A A A A A A		
1	216-631-1425										
00	David Latina, Sales Mgr.										
	email: dlats722@ontariostone.com	mo							tota addition	DELANA	
10				VC LLY	111	CEA OD no hid	bid o	*******	NO BID	*****	*****
H	Kokosing Materials, Inc.	\$63.00 no bid	no bid		no pid		200				
12	P.O. Box 334										
13	Fredericktown, OH 43019										
14	740-694-9585										
15	Ralph Kyanko, Asst. Sec.										
1	email: dag3@kokosing.biz										
17				*****	*****	*****	****	\$16.95	\$17.55	\$21.35	\$22.10
18	AREA Aggregates, LLC	****	NO BID					delivered	delivered	delivered	delivered
19	606 E. 152 St.										
20	Cleveland, OH 44110										
21	216-630-2415										
22	Stephen R. Hollis, Site Mgr.							12 10 5			
23	email: srh@theolencorp.biz				and a second sec						
24			1	****	*****	*****	*****	\$18.90	0 \$19.25	5 \$23.90	0 \$24.30
25	Osborne Concrete & Stone	***	NO BID			The second second		delivered	delivered	delivered	delivered
26	1 Williams Road		a construction of the								
27	P.O. Box 249										
28	Grand River, OH 44045										
29											
30	Dennis Opatrny, President										
31	-								Para and		
32			1 11	APA AN		\$40 DD	NO BID	******	* NO BID	*****	*****
33	-	\$59.00	O BID	nninc¢	INO DIO	por ot c					
34	1 6 US Coast Guard Road										
35	Painesville, OH 44077										
36	5 440-357-5562							-			_
27	77 Donnie Onatrow President										

ORDINANCE NO. 2018-15 "Exhibit A" Page 3 of 4

F	×	-	0	0	ш	ш	9	Т	I	-	X
+	A)	ASPHA	ASPHALT (\$\$\$)				LIMESTONE (\$\$\$	(\$\$\$)	
_		Tunn 1	Tune 1 del	Tune 7	Tvbe 2 del.	301	301 del.	304	411	57	1'S &2'S
39 0	Company Name	r addi	2								
		******	NO BID	******	****	****	****	\$16.85	\$17.40	\$20.95	\$21.42
41								delivered	delivered	delivered	delivered
42 (6509 Brecksville Road #31601										
43 (Cleveland, OH 44131										
44	440-546-1900										
45	Steve Piscitello, President						-			-	
46	email: sostruckingohio@gmail.com	com									
47						******	*****	¢10.07	¢18.67	\$22.91	\$22.99
48	Arms Trucking	******	NO BID	****	***			Adivered	delivered	delivered	delivered
49	P.O. Box 369							מכווגבובת			
50	14818 Mayfield Road							-	-		
51	E. Claridon, OH 44033										
52	800-362-1343					I		-			4
53	Howard Bates, President										
54	email: howard@armstrucking.com	com						Part of the		- proving	OTTO VILLE
55						¢r4 00	hid on	*****	NO BID	******	*****
56	Stoneco, Inc. dba Allied Corp.	\$61.00	NO BID	\$52.00	NO BID	nn-Teč			2	1.	
57	8920 Canyon Falls #120							and an and a second			
58	1										
59	-										
09	Steve Conklin, VP & Gen. Mgr.										
61	100	E									
62				*****	*****	*****	*****	\$17.95	\$ \$19.05	5 \$22.95	\$22.95
63	Shelly Materials	****	NO BID	* * * * * * *	_			delivered	delive	delivered	delivered
64	8920 Canyon Falls #120							-	1		
65	Twinsburg, OH 44087										
66	330-425-7861										
67	Chad Reel, VP										
68	email: rpalladino@shellyco.com	m		-							
69								De a re			
70										The second	
71											
72											
73											
VL											

A side a

. .

ORDINANCE NO. 2018-15 "Exhibit A" Page 4 of 4