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@ity of Willoughhy AHills

Interoffice Memo

Date: Monday, February 15, 2016

To: All members of Council, Council Clerk Victoria Savage,
From: Mayor Robert M. Weger

Subject: Ordinance to Accept Limestone and Asphalt Bids

A bid opening was held on Friday, February 12, 2016, in response to our ad for our
2016 Asphalt and Limestone Program. A summary of all of the bids that were
submitted is attached. Road Superintendent Mark Grubiss has requested that we
accept the following as the lowest and best bid and | respectfully request that
Council prepare an ordinance to allow me to accept the following bids:

Asphalt Bid and Limestone Bid presented by Osborne Concrete & Stone
| would appreciate your consideration in passing this ordinance with an Emergency
Clause which would eliminate thirty days from signing and allow us to begin road

repair that much sooner. In addition, you may consider waiving the three-reading
rule to once again allow for the paving to begin sooner.

cc: Mark Grubiss, Road Superintendent
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Company Name
Ontario Stone Corp.
1246 River Road
Cleveland, OH 44113
216-631-1425

William Toth, Sales Mgr,

Kokosing Materials, Inc.
P.O.Box 334
Fredericktown, OH 43019
740-694-9585

Ralph Kyanko, Asst. Sec.

Allied Corp.

8920 Canyon Falls Blvd. #120Q
Twinsburg, OH 44087
330-425-7861

Mr. Brian Zele, VP

Shelly Materials

8920 Canyon Falls #120
Twinsburg, OH 44087
330-425-7861

Mr. Brian Zele, VP
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Oshorne Concrete & Stone
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1 Williams Road
P.O. Box 248

1o
Len ]

Grand River, OH 44045

w
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440-357-5562

(ad
N

Gary Bradler, Pres.
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Type 1 Type 1 del.
LELES = & 3 _ZO W_D

$60.00 no bid

$58.00 add $12

LR XS 2 2]

NO BID

$57.00 no bid

ASPHALT (558)
Type 2 Type 2 del.

kEFFEFF¥

$52.00 no bid

$49.00 add 512.

EkkEE kR

$48.25 no bid

LA EEEE S S R LSS

LIMESTONE {555)

304 411

$17.45 $17.70
delivered delivered

57 1'S &2'S
$21.50 $22.25
delivered delivered

301 301 del.

EE Rk

RkkERKE  RRRRKE

$51.00 nobid  ******** NOBID

ok ko

$48.00 add 512 ***¥*¥*  NQ BID

LR X2 L

LR S E L FREXER

$16.95
delivered delivered

m:.mo. $21.45 $21.45
delivered .nm.?man

$16.80 $17.00
.am_am_.ma delivered

$46.75 no bid $21.50  $21.50

delivered delivered
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ORDINANCE NO. 2016-6
ORDINANCE NO, 20]6-7
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City of Willoughby Hills
Bidding Document

ASPHALT Requirements for | (one) year: 2016

Delivered, as directed,
to locations within

Picked UP corporate city limits
2,000 tons ODOT 448 Type 1 Asphalt Concrete* § 57.00 per ton b N/A per ton
(Surface Course)
1,000 tons ODOT 448 Type 2 Asphalt Concrete* $ .25 perton $ N/A per ton
(Intermediate Course)
500 tons ODOT 301 Asphalt Concrete Base®*  § 46. 75 perton 5 N/A per ton

{Tonnage of material is approximate usage — may purchase more or less)

*All asphalt cements shall meet AASHTO Provisional Standard MPI or any superseding AASHTO specification for

performance graded asphalt cement binder Pg. 64-22. The biluminous mixes shall meet 0.D.0.T. Speeifications
{2008 Edition)

The supplier shail provide documentation and certification to verify the above. The supplier shall also submit
with the bid a proposed JMF for each mix.

ODOT 401.20 - “Asphalt Binder Price Adjustment” shall apply to this contract.

Plant Location(s): Provide on separate sheet if needed.

Location of Plant Nearest to Willoughby Hills: _No. 6 Coast Guard Rd., Grand River, OH 44045

Alternate Plant Locations: 1 Williams St., Grand River. OH 44045

Note: The above items may be bid in total or in part,

On itemns not bid, please enter “ § No Bid per ton™

5% bid bond or certified check required.

Qsborne Concrete & Stone
Company Name

1 Williams St., P.0. Box 249, Grand River, OH 44045
Compmiy Address, Ciny, State & Zip

440-357-5562 ,
Company Phene Number / >

/‘.’*"”/./ .

[Bid Opening: Friday, February 12, 2016
neon
Willoughby Hills Council Chambers

//ng/ﬁa’ < //C{.////

Printed Nanme & Title
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City of Willoughby Hills
Bidding Document

LIMESTONE Requirements for 1 (one) year: 2016

Delivered in truck-load quantities, as requested, and unloaded at:

Willcughby Hills Service Garage

35405 Chardon Road

Willoughby Hills, OH 44094

OR OTHER LOCATIONS, AS DIRECTED, WITHIN THE CORPORATE CITY LIMITS.

16.80

200 tons ODQOT 304 Limestone s per ton delivered
500 tons ODOT 411 Limestone S 17.00 per ton delivered
500 tons ODOT 57 Limestone $ 21.50 per ton delivered
200 tons ODOT 1 & 2 Limestone Blend b 21.50 per ton delivered

(Tonnage of material is approximate usage — may purchase more or less)

Note: The zbove items may be bid in total or in part.

On items not bid, please enter "$ No Bid per ton”

5% bid bond or certified check required,

_(sharne Concrefe & Stone
Company Name

1 Williams St., P.0. Box 249, Grand River, OH 44045

Company Address, City, State & Zip
440-357-5562

¥

‘v ! ; S
Printed Name & Title ' s i d

ing: Friday, February 12, 2016
Noon
Willoughby Hills Council Chambers




